Option ltem

Badder
Item 1
16-Passenger Configuration
Cenlral States Bus Seles (Goshen)
Central States Bus Sales (Starcrafty
Diamond State Bus Company (Coach and Equipment)
Diamond State Bus Company (El Dorado National)
National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Winnebago)
National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Elkhat Coach 5 41)
National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Elkhart Coach 6.81)

Ttem 2

20-Passenger Configuration

Cenlral States Bus Sales (Goshen)

Central States Bus Sales (Starcrafl)

Diamond State Bus Company (Coach and Equipment)
Diamond Slate Bus Company (El Dorado National)
National Bus Sates and Leasing, Inc (Winnebago)
National Bus Satcs and Leasing, Inc (Elkhat Coach 5.41)
National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Elkhart Coach 6 1)

Ttem 3
24 Pavsenger Configuration

Central States Bus Sales (Goshen)

Cenural States Bus Sales (Starcraf)

Diamond State Bus Company (Coach and Equipment)
Diamond State Bus Company (El Dorado National)
National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc. (Winncbago)
National Bus Sates and Leasing, Ine (Elkhat Coach 5 41)
National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Elkhart Coach 6.81)

Analysis based oo ADA Build Unit Cost with 2 wheelchair positions.

liem I 8 Passenger with WC lift +2WC pasitions Configuration with most requested options.
Central Stales Bus Sales (Goshen)

Cenlral States Bus Sales (Starerafl)

Diamond State Bus Company (Coach and Equipment)

Diamond Stale Buy Company (El Dorado Natiopal)

National Bus Sates and Leasing, Inc (Winncbago)

Nalional Bus Sates and Leasing, Inc (Elkhat Coach 5.41)

National Bus Sates and Leasing, Inc (Elkhart Coach 6 81)

Diamond State Bus Company (E| Dorado Natioaal) is Lowest Responsive Bidder on [tem 1

Ttem 2 12 Passenger with WC lift +2C positions Configuration with masi requested options.
Cenlral States Bus Sales (Goshen)

Central States Bus Sales (Starcraft)

Diamond State Bus Company (Coach and Equipment)

Diamond State Bus Company (El Dorado National)

Nalional Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Winnebago)

National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc. (Elkhal Coach 5 41)

National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc (Elkhart Coach 6 81)

Diamond State Bas Company (El Dorado National) is Lowest Responsive Bidder on ltem 2

Item 3 16 Passenger with EC 1ift +2WC pasitions Canfiguration with mast requested options.
Cenlral Siates Bus Sales (Goshen)

Central States Bus Sales (Starcrall)

Diamond Stale Bus Company (Coach and Equipment)

Diamond Stat Bus Compeny (E} Dorado National)

Nalional Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc. (Winnebago)

Nalional Bus Salcs and Leasing, Inc. (Elkhat Coach 5 41)

National Bus Sales and Leasing, Inc, (Elkhart Coach 6.81)

Diamond State Bus Company (El Dorzdo National) Is Lowest Responsive Bidder on ltem 3

Oepseoled.

Date . 10-al-2.013

Price Quole

Standard Passenger  Wheelchair

Configuration

341,708
340,996
344,551
$40,083

no bid
$40,226
340,986

344,207
$43,067
346,357
342,144
345,649
$42,340
$43,271

$45,699
$44,754
$48,524
$43,769

no bid
$44,196
845,127

341,708
$40,996
$44,551
$40,08)

no bid
$40,226
$40,986

$44,207
$43,067
$46,357
$42,144
$45,649
$42,340
543271

$45,69%
544,754
548,524
243,769

no bid
$44,196
45,127

A

Qnrde d 85 [rans

Lift

$3,707
$2273
$2,465
$2,350
no bid
32,873
52,873

$3.707
$2,273
$2.465
52,350
$3.037
52,873
52873

£3,707
52273
$2,465
52,350
no bid
52,873
52873

33,707
22713
32,465
32,350
no bid
32373
32873

33,707
32273
32,465
$2,350
33,037
32873
$2.373

§3.707
32273
$2.465
$2.350
no bid
32,873
32,873

mam,a%

B

10001b
Wheclchair
Lin

$4,207
32,595
$2.683
$3,175

33,167
$3,167

$4,207
$2,595
2,683
83,175
$3,337
$3,167
$3,167

$4,207
52,595
52,683
$3.175

$3,167
$3,167

Wheelchair
Restraint

3389
$329
3500
$275
no bid
$413
3413

$389
3329
3500
3275
3305
13
413

3389
3329
3500
5275
no bid
$413
3413

3718
$658
31,000
3550
no bid
3826
3826

3778
$658
$1,000
3550
3610
$B26
3826

5778
3658
$1,000
$550
no bid
3826
$826

Backup
Camera

$386
3315
3300
$300
no bid
3413
$413

$386
3315
3300
3300
$326
$413
3413

3386
3315
3300
$300
no bid
$413
3413

3386
$315
3300

no bid
§413
3413

3386
3315
3300

3326
3413
413

$386
3315
3300

no bid
3413
413

E

Safely
Bumper
(Rear)

3633
$403
$494
$400
no bid
$511
$511

3633
$403
3494
3400
3401
3511
3511

3633
3403
3494
3400
o bid
3511
$511

3633
3403
3494

no bid
$511
ss11

$633
$403
$494

$401
$50
$511

3633
§403
$494

no bid
$511
$s11

Child Alert
System

5150
395
5297
$100
1o bid
393
393

3150
395
3297
5100
3103
393
393

3150
$95
3297
3100
o bid
593
393

3150
395
$297
3100
no bid
393
393

$150
195
5297
3100
5103
593
393

5150
395
5297
$100
no bid
593
393

G

LED
Destination
Sign

$6,500
52,940
$4,063
$7,500
o bid
$4,208
$4.208

6,500
$2,940
$4,063
$7,500
$6,422
$4,208
34,208

$6,500
$2,940
4,063
$7,500
no bid
$4,208
4,208

$688
3480
$774
$650
no bid
3126
$726

3688
$480
$774
3650
3619
$726
$7126

8688
3480
§774

no bid
$726
$726

3250
$540
3382
$980
no bid
$318
3318

3250
$540
5382
5980
$600
3318
$318

3250
$540
§382
5980
no bid
s
3318

3 K L M
Child
Optional Restraint  Seat Belt
Passenger  Double Fold System (Per  Exensions
Seats  AwaySeat  Seal) (Each)
3625 $1,175 $100 530
$1,000 S1,118 $100 525
$1.851 $720 348 $50
51,744 $510 365 545
10 bid no bid no bid 1o bid
52,931 1,067 367 58
$2,931 1,067 367 58
3625 81,175 $t00 $30
$1,000 SLIL5 $100 $25
$2.341 $720 $48 $50
$2,088 3510 $65 345
$536 584 $80 26
$3,663 51,067 367 $8
53,663 $1.067 867 8
$625 $1,175 $100 $30
51,000 $1.115 $100 825
53240 $720 348 $50
52416 3510 365 $45
no bid 10 bid no bid no bld
$4,39 $1,067 867 $8
$4,39% 51,067 867 8
$1,175
$1,115
$720
3510
10 bid
$1,067
51,067
51,175
1,115
$720
510
$584
$1,067
$1,067
$1,175
$1,115
$720
$510
no bid
$1,067
$1,067

Mor/Ryde
Suspension

31247
$1,080
3780
3950
no bid
3807
3807

$1.247

$1,080
3364
3950
3825
3870
3870

31,47
31,080
3864
$950
no bid
SB70
3870

o

Fabric

(Per Seal)

57

37

$0
345
o bid
545
845

57

345
0 bid
345
345

Upholstery ~ Safety Exit
Ventilator

3470
3245
3364
3225
no bid
3245
8245

3470
$245
3364
$225
3245
3245
$245

3470
3245
$364
$225
no bid
$245
$245

$470
3245
3364

3245
$245
5245

$470
5245
$364

no bid
3245
$245

STD Double
Foldaway

Seat

3800
3800

no bid

3800
3800

3800
3800

no bid

Reduction
Single Seat

$215
s100
387
$165
no bid
$132
1132

215
$100
387
$i65
5235
$132
5132

5215
$100
$87

s165
no bid
5132
3132

3215
($100)
87
($165)
no bid
(5132
($132)

($215)
(5100)
87
($165)
(5235)
($132)
($132)

(5215)
($100)
(387)
($165)
no bid
(3132
($132)

Reduction

Reduction Service
Double Seal  Manual

3400 325
$200 350
5187 30
$320 30
no bid no bid
$257 $7
3257 37
$400 325
$200 3§50
5187 30
$320 30
3365 50
5257 $7
3257 57
3400 $25
5200 $50
5187 50
3320 30
no bid no bid
3257 37
3257 57

Price Comparison
Bus with ADA Equipmen(

(81,600)
(8800)
($748)

(31,280)
no bid

(51,028)

(81.028)

(81.600)
($800)
(5748)

(31.280)

(81.460)

(31,028

(51,028)

(51.600)
(3800)
($748)

($1230)
no bid

(51,028)

(31,028)

$45,722
544,955
$48,992
$42,848

o bid
$44,849
45,609

549,691
847271
551,162
$45,134
549,260
$47,208
348,139

351,183
348,958
$53,329
346,759

no bid
$49,064
349,995

Difference

$3,874
32,107
36,144
30
no bid
$2,001
32,761

$4.557
32,137
36,028
0
$4.126
$2.074
$3,005

$4.424
$2,199
$6,570

no bid
32,305
$3236
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