ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-203J

Page 1
Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG Mc-800 | summer High Perf
BIDDERS 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 Cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price
[APAC-Central, Inc. *+ *+ *+ *+ + *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+
Arkhola Division
Preston
60.00 | 66.00 | 68.25 | 63.00 | 68.00 | 74.00 | 72.00 | 77.50 | 85.00 | 74.00 100.00 | 100.00 **
479-788-6344
[APAC-Central, Inc. *+ *+ *+ *+ + *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+
Arkhola Division
Jenny Lind, AR
Y 60.00 | 66.00 | 68.25 | 63.00 | 68.00 | 74.00 | 72.00 | 77.50 | 85.00 | 74.00 100.00 | 100.00 **
479-788-6344
[APAC-Central, Inc.
Arkhola Division
Centerton No Bid Received
479-795-2959
[APAC-Central, Inc. *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+
Arkhola Division
Sharps
P 53.00 | 58.00 | 66.00 | 55.50 | 61.50 | 71.00 | 63.00 | 73.00 | 76.00 | 69.50 62.00 65.00 100.00 | 100.00 **
479-788-6344
IAPAC-Central, Inc. *+ *+ *+ *+ *+ *+
Arkhola Division
Valley Springs
¥ =pring 75.00 77.00 62.00 65.00 100.00 | 100.00 =
479-788-6344
[APAC-Central, Inc.
Arkhola Division
West Fork No Bid Received
479-839-8514
(APAC-Mississippi, Inc.
Greenville, MS
662-335-8600 Not on Qualified Products List
** SEE ATTACHED SHEET
*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY Tentatively Awarded By: Purchasing Committee DATE: June 10, 2014

+ORDERS FOR A MINIMUM TONNAGE MAY BE REQUIRED

Awarded To: As Per Tabulation
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG | mcs0o | summer | High Pert.
BIDDERS 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | €4-22 | 7022 | 7622 | 64-22 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 76-22 | cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price
[APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Forrest City, AR
870-630-1290 .
62.50 | 67.50 | 72.00 | 64.00 | 69.00 | 72.00 | 65.50 | 72.50 | 75.00 | 66.50 | 73.50 | 76.00 | 66.50 | 73.50 | 76.00 | 66.50 [ 73.50 | 76.00 110.00 |.35/tn per mile
[APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Memphis, TN
901-942-1800 .
59.50 | 64.50 | 69.00 | 61.00 | 66.00 | 69.00 | 63.50 | 70.50 | 73.50 | 63.50 | 70.50 | 73.50 | 63.50 | 70.50 | 73.50 | 63.50 [ 70.50 | 73.50 .35/tn per mile
[APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
West Memphis, AR
J870-735-2880 )
59.50 | 64.50 | 69.00 | 61.00 | 66.00 | 69.00 | 63.50 | 70.50 | 73.50 | 63.50 | 70.50 | 73.50 | 63.50 | 70.50 | 73.50 | 63.50 [ 70.50 | 73.50 .35/tn per mile
APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Wynne, AR
901-947-5600 No Bid Received
Asphalt Producers, LLC
Valley View
870-932-1. i
870-932-1306 49.20 52.21 59.38 | 62.71 61.49 57.34 9500 | 2nmie
w/4.00 min
Asphalt Products LLC * * *
Little Rock, AR
501-490-0718
63.00 | 68.00 | 73.00 | 65.00 | 70.00 | 75.00 | 67.00 | 72.00 | 77.00 | 70.00 | 75.00 | 80.00 85.00 | 85.00 100.00
Atlas Asphalt, Inc.
Rose Bud
1870-251-2371 i
870251-23 60.00 60.00 | 65.00 66.50 | 71.25 95.00 [ 95.00 [ 95.00 -25/n mile

w/4.00 min




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-203J
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG Mc-800 | summer High Perf.
BIDDERS 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 Cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price
Atlas Asphalt, Inc.
Mountain View
1870-251-2371 i
70.00 71.00 9500 | 9500 | 9500 [ 25N mie
w/4.00 min
Atlas Asphalt, Inc.
Batesville, AR
Midwest Lane i
60.00 | 65.00 60.00 | 65.00 63.75 | 67.50 | 76.00 | 63.75 61.50 9500 | 9500 | 9500 [ 25N mie
le70-251-2371 W/4.00 min
Atlas Asphalt, Inc.
Batesville, AR
Violet Hill No Bid Received
[870-251-2371
Atlas Asphalt, Inc.
Black Rock, AR
870-932-1246 ) .
60.00 60.00 63.50 | 68.75 9500 | 23nmie
w/3.00 min
Atlas Asphalt, Inc.
102 Bearden Drive
[Jonesboro, AR ) .
48.86 53.20 54.01 | 58.42 57.63 53.58 94.95 23/tn mile
Je70-932-1246 Wi2.75 min
Blackstone Const., LLC * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Russellville, AR
Plant 1 & 2 . i
60.00 | 65.00 | 71.00 | 60.00 | 65.00 | 71.00 | 67.00 | 69.00 | 75.00 | 70.00 | 76.00 | 81.00 100.00 100.00 25/tn ml.le
479-968-1149 w/3.25min.
Covington Enterprises, Inc * *
Lowell, AR
479-872-9993
55.00 57.00

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG | mcs0o | summer | High Pert.
BIDDERS 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 | cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price
Covington Enterprises., Inc
Batesville, AR
479-795-1133 No Bid Received
Cranford Construction Co.
Bryant, AR
501-945-7176 No Bid Received
Cranford Construction Co.
No.Little Rock, AR
501-945-7176 No Bid Received
Cranford Construction Co.
Little Rock, AR
501-945-7176 No Bid Received
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Black Rock, AR
J870-878-6307 .30/tn mil
61.50 | 66.90 62.00 | 69.20 57.75 58.00 nmre
w/$4.00 min
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Bee Branch
501-745-3693 .30/tn mil
60.50 | 63.50 62.40 | 66.50 64.40 | 70.35 95.00 [ 95.00 [ 95.00 nme
w/$4.00 min
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Judsonia, AR
501-727-4601 .30/t il
61.50 | 65.50 62.25 | 66.50 63.00 | 70.00 95.00 [ 95.00 [ 95.00 nme
w/$4.00 min




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-203J
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) (37.5) (2) (25.0) (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) (7) (8) 9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG | mcs0o | summer | High Pert.
BIDDERS 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | e4-22 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 76-22 | 6422 | 7022 | 76-22 | cutback | Grade | Cold Mix Haul Price
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Luxora, AR
870-658-2453 i
61.00 62.50 | 67.75 65.50 | 67.75 62.50 62.50 95.00 | 95.00 95.00 30/tn mile
w/$4.00 min
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR
870-573-6262 i
57.50 58.30 | 64.75 61.00 | 65.00 56.25 | 60.75 56.25 | 63.25 95.00 | 95.00 95.00 30/tn mile
w/$4.00 min
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Tuckerman, AR
870-349-2 .
870-349-2995 62.50 62.50 62.50 62.50 95.00 | 95.00 95.00 30/tn mile
w/$4.00 min
R. K. Hall Construction LTD.
Kirby, AR
- -127 i
903-559-1276 76.00 | 84.00 | 88.00 | 76.00 | 84.00 | 88.00 | 83.00 | 88.00 | 92.00 | 86.00 | 93.00 | 98.00 30/tn mile
w/$6.00 min
R. K. Hall Construction LTD.
DeQueen, AR
870-642-271 i
8706 o 72.00 | 78.00 | 82.00 | 72.00 | 78.00 | 82.00 | 79.00 | 84.00 | 89.00 | 82.00 | 89.00 | 94.00 30/tn mile
w/$6.00 min
R. K. Hall Construction LTD.
Texarkana, AR
f§870-773-7071 i
870-773-70 72.00 | 78.00 | 82.00 | 72.00 | 78.00 | 82.00 | 79.00 | 84.00 | 89.00 | 82.00 | 89.00 | 94.00 30/tn mile
w/$6.00 min
HUIChenS COI’ISII’UCtiOn * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Company
Pl i le, AR
Sonora Plant, Springdale, 54.00 | 59.00 | 67.00 | 56.00 | 62.00 | 71.50 | 57.00 | 65.00 | 72.00 | 56.00 | 66.00 | 75.00 | 53.00 | 62.00 | 71.00 | 54.00 | 64.00 | 73.00 | 86.00 | 86.00 -
479-365-6610

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

** SEE ATTACHED SHEET




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-203J
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG | mcs0o | summer | High Pert.
BIDDERS 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 7622 | €4-22 | 7022 | 7622 | 64-22 | 7022 | 7622 | 6422 | 7022 | 76-22 | cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price
Hutchens Construction * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Company
Gravette, AR
54.00 | 59.00 | 67.00 | 56.00 | 62.00 | 71.50 | 57.00 | 65.00 | 72.00 | 56.00 | 66.00 | 75.00 | 53.00 | 62.00 | 71.00 | 54.00 | 64.00 | 73.00 | 86.00 | 86.00 >
479-298-0052
Jay-Pac, Inc.
Plumerville, AR
501-354-4175
68.00 | 72.70 70.00 | 78.70 98.00 | 98.00
Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc *
East Camden, AR
|870-574-1840 .20/ton mile
102.00 w/100.00 min.
Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. * * * * * * * * * *
Eagle Mills-Bearden, AR
870-574-0691 i
68.00 | 71.00 71.00 | 75.00 75.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 102.00 207ton mile
w/100.00 min
Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. * * * * * * * * * *
Fordyce, AR
870-352-0375 i
68.00 | 71.00 71.00 | 75.00 75.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 102.00 -20/ton mile
w/100.00 min.
Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc. * * * * * * * * * *
El Dorado, AR
870-863-7801 i
68.00 | 71.00 71.00 | 75.00 75.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 | 81.00 | 86.00 102.00 201t mile
w/100.00 min

[JoB Const. Co., Inc.
Poteau , OK Yard

918-647-8284 (W.D. Hoffman)

No Bid Received

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY
** SEE ATTACHED SHEET
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Page 7
Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG | vc-s0o | summer | righ Pert.
BIDDERS 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 | cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price

Lehman-Roberts Co.

Friar's Point, MS

662-383-2741 (Michael Ellis) No Bid Received

Lehman-Roberts Co.

Carrier Rd Extended

Memphis, TN Not on Qualified Products List

901-345-3826 (John D. Greene

Leo Journagan Const. Co.

Taney, Co, MO

417-337-8872 No Bid Received

Martin Marietta

Materials, Inc.

Jones Mil 63.05 | 66.90 | 69.75 | 65.75 | 70.10 | 74.00 | 71.95 | 76.35 | 81.80 | 75.85 | 83.05 | 85.90 94.85

501-844-4707

North Central Arkansas

Quarry Inc.

Mountain Home, AR No Bid Received
870-425-7780

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel * * * * * * * * * * * *

Company

Monticello .30/tn mile
J870-534-7120 77.00 | 82.00 80.00 | 86.00 81.00 | 90.00 | 93.00 | 84.00 | 90.00 | 96.00 112.00 115.00 W/$4.00 min.
Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co. * * * * * * * * * * *

Kansas Street & River

Pine Bluff .30/tn mile
870-534-7120 70.00 | 74.00 71.00 | 79.00 73.00 | 83.00 | 86.00 | 75.00 | 83.00 | 88.00 103.00 W/$4.00 min.

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014
ACHM ACHM ACHM Surface Course Asphalt Concrete
Base Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate Cold Plant Mix Special
SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407 SECTION 411 Provision
(1) 875 () (25.0 (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5) 7) (8) (9) (10)
PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG PG Mc-800 | summer High Perf.

BIDDERS 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 64-22 70-22 76-22 Cutback | Grade Cold Mix Haul Price
Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR
501-329-8360 No Bid Received
Rogers Group, Inc.
Greenbrier, AR
501-679-6230 Not on Qualified Products List
Rogers Group, Inc.
Cabot, AR
501-843-5154 .30/tn mile

58.00 | 61.00 | 66.00 | 60.00 | 65.00 | 71.00 | 64.00 | 69.00 | 75.00 | 66.00 | 71.00 | 78.00 95.00 | 95.00 W/$3.50 min.
Rogers Group Inc.
Springfield, AR
501-477-2106 No Bid Received
Twin Lakes Quarry's * * * *
Mountain Home, AR
|870-425-4510
62.90 62.90 62.90 .60/tn mile

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-203J

Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014

APAC CENTRAL, INC.
DUMP TRUCK MILEAGE HAUL RATES
Effective: Jul 1, 2014 thru Sep 30, 2014

lenny Lind, Preston, & Van Buren Sand Plant

Opening Date: June 3, 2014

APAC CENTRAL, INC.
DUMP TRUCK MILEAGE HAUL RATES
Effective: Jul 1, 2014 thru Sep 30, 2014

Page 9

Sharps, Valley Springs, Hindsville, Avoca, & Bella Vista Plants

MILES PER TON RATE MILES ~ PER TOM RATE
0-6 - s31s 3 $7.05
7-12 53,60 32 57.25
13 53.80 33 57.50
14 "~ $3.90 34 $7.70
15 $4.10 35 $7.95
16 54,25 36 $8.05
17 54.30 37 58.20
18 £4.50 38 $8.40
19 54.60 39 $8.55
20 54.75 40 58.75
21 54.95 41 $8.95
22 $5.20 42 59.10
23 55.40 43 59.30
24 55.65 44 £9.40
25 $5.85 45 %9.60
26 £6.05 46 59.70
27 56.25 47 $9.90
28 $6.50 48 $10.05
29 $6.65 49 $10.25
30 $6.85 50 $10.40

MILES Rate Rip Rap
- 0-10 $0.35 5045
11-20 $0.35 50.45 I
21-30 $0.25 $0.35
Owver 30 50.25 $0.35

Add 51.00 per ton for Cold Mix or Hot Mix

51 Miles & Over 0.2075per ton mile

Add $2.00 per ton for 18" Rip rap

20 ton Minimum haul charge

Note:

All haul rate quotes are on a per-ton mile basis and are rounded

to the nearest mile to the delivery site.

$2.50/ton minimum haul rate.



ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
Asphalt Concrete Cold Plant and Hot Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-203J

Page 10

Date of Contract: July 1, 2014 thru September 30, 2014 Opening Date: June 3, 2014

—— —— — — — — ——— — — —

Main Office: 1007 Main Strest - Cassville, MO 65625
phone (417) 847-2489 - Fax (417) 847-5561
Taoll Free (888) PAVEITZ - (888) 728-3482

www. hutchensconstruction.com

Rock | Asphalt | Rock | Asphalt Rock | Asphatt | | | Rock | Asphalt |
1] 1.61 | 1.92 17| 4.95 | 5.78 | |[33] 8.27 | 9.64 49| 11.60 | 13.46
2 | 182 | 2.16 18| 5.14 | 6.02 34| 8.45 | 9.85 50| 11.79 | 13.70
3| 2.01 | 2.42 19| 5.34 | 6.25 35| 8.68 | 10.12 | |[51] 12.00] 13.95
A 223 2.6 20| 5.55 | 6.49 36| 8.89 | 10.35| |52 12.22 | 14.21
5| 2.44 | 2.87 21| 5.77 | 6.73 37| 9.11 | 10.59 53| 12.43 | 14.45
G B Bl 22| 5.96 | 6.97 38| 9.30 | 10.83| (54| 12.62 | 14.69
7 | 2.85 | 3.38 23] 6.17 | 7.22 39| 9.51 [ 11.08| |55 12.84| 14.94
8 | 3.07 | 3.62 24| 6.38 | 7.46 40| 9.73 | 11.32 56| 13.05 | 15.15
9 | 3.29 | 3.86 25| 6.60 | 7.70 41| 9.94 [11.54 57| 13.27 | 15.40
10| 3.50 | 4.10 26| 6.79 | 7.92 | [42]10.13| 11.78 58| 13.46 | 15.64
11] 3.69 | 4.35 27| 7.01 | 8.17 43| 10.35 [ 12.03 59| 13.67 | 15.89
12| 3.90 | 4.57 28| 7.22 | 8.41 44| 10.56 | 12.27 60] 13.90 | 16.13
13| 4.11 | 4.81 29| 7.43 | 8.67 45| 10.78 | 12.51 61| 14.12 | 16.37
14| 4.30 | 5.05 30| 7.62 | 8.91 | [46]10.97 | 12.75| [62] 14.31 ] 16.61
15| 4.52 | 5.30 31| 7.83 | 9.16 471 11.18 13.00 63| 14.52 | 16.84
16| 4.73 | 5.54 32| 8.05 | 9.40 48] 11.40 | 13.22 64| 14.74 | 17.08




