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APAC-Central, Inc.

Arkhola Division

Preston

479-788-6344

 

APAC-Central, Inc.

Arkhola Division

Jenny Lind, AR

479-788-6344

APAC-Central, Inc.

Arkhola Division

Centerton

479-795-2959

APAC-Central, Inc.

Arkhola Division

Sharps

479-788-6344

APAC-Central, Inc.

Arkhola Division

Valley Springs

479-788-6344

APAC-Central, Inc.

Arkhola Division

West Fork

479-839-8514

APAC-Mississippi, Inc.

Greenville, MS

662-335-8600

Date:  8/27/2014Awarded By:  Purchasing Committee

Awarded To:  As Per Tabulation

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

Haul Price

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

Bidders

Special Provision

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received
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APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

Forrest City, AR

870-630-1290

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

Memphis, TN

901-942-1800

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

West Memphis, AR

870-735-2880

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

Wynne, AR

901-947-5600

Asphalt Producers, LLC

Valley View

870-932-1306

 

Asphalt Products LLC

Little Rock, AR

501-407-9643

 

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Batesville, AR

Rose Bud

870-251-2371

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

+Please call 2 weeks in advance the first time you order to ensure product on hand.  Minimum order of 100 tons within 3 month period.

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

Special Provision

95.00 .25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

110.00 .35/tn per mile

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Bidders

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

.23/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

No Bid Received

100.00
*+

Haul Price

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

94.45
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Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Batesville, AR

Mountain View

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Batesville, AR

Midwest Lane

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Batesville, AR

Violet Hill

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Jonesboro, AR

Black Rock, AR

870-932-1246

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Jonesboro, AR

102 Bearden Drive

870-932-1246

Blackstone Const., LLC

Russellville, AR

Plant 1 & 2

479-968-1149

Covington Enterprises, Inc.

Lowell, AR

479-872-9993

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

Special Provision

Haul PriceBidders

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

No Bid Received

94.92 .23/tn per mile w/$2.75 min.

No Bid Received

100.00 .25/tn per mile w/$3.25 min.

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

95.00 .25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

95.00 .25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

95.00 .25/tn per mile w/$3.00 min.
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Covington Enterprises., Inc.

Bentonville, AR

479-795-1133

Cranford Construction Co.

Bryant, AR

501-945-7176

Cranford Construction Co.

No.Little Rock, AR

501-945-7176

Cranford Construction Co.

Little Rock, AR

501-945-7176

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Black Rock, AR

870-878-6307

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Bee Branch

501-745-3693

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Judsonia, AR

501-729-4601

No Bid Received

.35/tn per mile 100.00

No Bid Received

Haul Price

Special Provision

Bidders

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

95.00 .35/tn per mile 

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

Rejected - No Bid Bond

No Bid Received

No Bid Received
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Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Luxora, AR

870-658-2545

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Paragould, AR

870-573-6882

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Tuckerman, AR

870-349-2995

R. K. Hall Construction LTD.

Kirby, AR

903-559-1276

R. K. Hall Construction LTD.

DeQueen, AR

870-642-2719

R. K. Hall Construction LTD.

Texarkana, AR

870-773-7071

Hutchens Construction

Company

Sonora Plant, Springdale, AR

479-365-6610

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

.35/tn per mile 

No Bid Received

Bidders

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

95.00

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

Special Provision

Haul Price

95.00 .35/tn per mile 

No Bid Received

95.00 .35/tn per mile 
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Hutchens Construction

Company

Gravette, AR

479-298-0052

Jay-Pac, Inc.

Plumerville, AR

501-354-4175

Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc.

East Camden, AR

870-574-1840

Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc.

Eagle Mills-Bearden, AR

870-574-0691

Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc.

Fordyce, AR

870-352-0375

Jet Asphalt & Rock Co., Inc.

El Dorado, AR

870-863-7801

JoB Const. Co., Inc.

Poteau , OK Yard

918-647-8284 

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Bidders

Special Provision

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

Haul Price

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

Rejected                 

Improper Bond Document

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton
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Lehman-Roberts Co. 

2360 Belmont Circle

Memphis, TN

901-481-9704

Lehman-Roberts Co. 

Carrier Rd. Extended

Memphis, TN

901-296-1495

Leo Journagan Const. Co.

Taney, Co, MO

417-337-8872

Martin Marietta

Materials, Inc.

Jones Mill

501-844-4707

North Central Arkansas 

Quarry Inc.

Mountain Home, AR

870-425-7780

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.

Company

Monticello

870-534-7120

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.

Kansas Street & River 

Pine Bluff

870-534-7120

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

.30/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.                 

Full Load Only

No Bid Received

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

145.00

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

145.00

Special Provision

Haul PriceBidders

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

117.00
*
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Rogers Group, Inc.

Conway, AR

501-329-8360

Rogers Group, Inc.

Greenbrier, AR

501-679-6230

Rogers Group, Inc.

Cabot, AR

501-843-5154

Rogers Group Inc.

Springfield, AR 

501-477-2106

Twin Lakes Quarry's

Mountain Home, AR

870-425-4510

Date of Contract: October 1, 2014 thru December 31, 2014                             Opening Date: August 19, 2014

100.00 .30/tn per mile w/$3.75 min.

High Performance Cold Mix 

Per Ton

No Bid Received

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-15-219J

Bidders

No Bid Received

100.00 .30/tn per mile w/$3.75 min.

No Bid Received

Special Provision

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Haul Price


