Arkansas State Highway and Transportation Department
Tabulation for H-16-230J - Vegetation Control Materials
STATEWIDE
Date of Contract: December 1, 2015 thru November 30, 2016

Date Opened: 10/27/2015

Page 1 of 2
ITEM1] MEM2 | [TEM3 | [TEM4 | [TEM5 | ITEM6| IHEM7 | TEM8 | ITEMO [ITEM 10] ITEM 11
MSMA Roundup Surfactant Drift Krenite-S Escort Telar Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau
(gal.) Custom (gal.) Control (gal.) XP XP PRO-CON. (gal) (oz.) (gal.)
(gal.) Agent (oz.) (oz.) (gal.)
(qt.)

Helena Chemical Co.
664 Hwy. 165 N. 21.50 14.90 *16.75 *16.00 60.58 4.20 15.65 14.42 53.40 13.65 120.00
Dewitt, AR 72041
870-946-3516, Bob Hynum
Red River Specialties, Inc.
1324 North Hearne Ave -Ste 120 26.25 15.15 15.65 7.83 61.25 3.35 15.16 14.89 48.89 14.05 113.30
Shreveport, LA 71107
1-800-256-3344 Kevin Tucker
Crop Production Services
140 Arkansas Street 23.49 15.39 11.39 7.99 67.25 4.22 14.99 14.69 46.44 16.49 113.30
Monticello, AR 71655
870-367-8561, Heidi Barrett
ChemTrade Turf, LLC
P O Box 16837 Bid Rejected - Incomplete Bid
Jonesboro, AR 72403
870-520-273-8585 Nick Williams
VM Distribution Partners
P.O. Box 1160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.35 14.89 No Bid No Bid 13.95 No Bid

Marshall, AR 72650
870-448-5414 George Phillips

Denotes - Award To Low Bidder *Low Bid meeting specs.
Tentatively Awarded By: Purchasing Committee Date: 11/16/2015

Awarded To: Helena Chemical Co. - Iltems 1-5, 8 & 10 (11/30/2015)
Awarded To: Red River Specialties, Inc. - ltems 6 & 11 (12/1/2015)
Awarded To: Crop Production Services - Item 9 only (11/30/2015)
Awarded To: VM Distribution Partners - Item 7 only (12/2/2015)

Tie Bid-Awarded by Lot




Date of Contract:

Arkansas State Highway and Transportation Department
Tabulation for H-16-230J - Vegetation Control Materials
List of Vegetation Control Chemicals By Trade Name and Manufacturer Provided by Vendors

December 1, 2015 thru November 30, 2016

Date Opened: 10/27/2015

Marshall, AR 72650

Page 2 of 2
ITEM1 | ITEM?2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEMS | ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8 ITEM9 |ITEM10| ITEM 11
MSMA Roundup Surfactant Drift Krenite-S Escort Telar Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau
(gal.) Custom (gal.) Control (gal.) XP XP PRO-CON. (oz.) (gal.)
(gal) (qt.) (0z.) (0z.) (gal.) (9al)
Helena Chemical Co.
664 Hwy. 165 North Target 6 Roundup Induce |Ground Zero Krenite-S | Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau
Dewitt, AR 72041 Plus Custom PRO-CON.
Red River Specialties, Inc.
1324 N. Hearne Avenue STE 120 MSMA Roundup Elite Elite Krenite-S | Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau
Shreveport, LA 71107 6 Plus Custom Platinum Secure Ultra PRO-CON.
Crop Production Services
140 Arkansas Street Target 6 Roundup Spreader Reign LC Krenite-S | Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau
Monticello, AR 71655 Plus Custom 90 PRO-CON.
ChemTrade Turf, LLC
P O Box 16837 Bid Rejected - Incomplete Bid
Jonesboro, AR 72403
VM Distribution Partners
P.O. Box 1160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Escort XP Telar XP No Bid No Bid Outrider No Bid




