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APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Memphis, TN
Forrest City
870-630-1290

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Memphis, TN
W. Memphis
870-735-2880

Asphalt Producers, LLC
Jonesboro, AR
Valley View
870-932-1306

Asphalt Products LLC
Little Rock, AR
501-407-9643
 

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1)
Batesville, AR
Rose Bud
870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1)
Batesville, AR
Mountain View
870-269-7222

Tentatively Awarded By: Date:  9/12/2016
Awarded To: 

.22/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

High Performance Cold Mix 
Per Ton

90.00

Purchasing Committee
As Per Tabulation

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2016 thru March 31, 2017                      Opening Date: August 25, 2016

Bidders

No Bid Received

Special Provision

.23/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

87.50

No Bid Received

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-17-226J

Haul Price

No Bid Received

.22/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

87.50
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Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1)
Batesville, AR
Midwest Lane
870-793-4581

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2)
Jonesboro, AR
Black Rock
870-932-1246

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2)
Jonesboro, AR
102 Bearden Drive
870-932-1246

Blackstone Construction LLC
Russellville, AR
Russellville Plant 1 & 3
479-968-1149

Covington Enterprises, Inc.
Rogers, AR
Bentonville
479-793-1133

Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
Little Rock
501-945-7176

Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
Malvern - Jones Mill
501-945-7176

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

Bidders

97.50

87.50 .22/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

87.50

*

.23/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

High Performance Cold Mix 
Per Ton

*
135.00

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2016 thru March 31, 2017                      Opening Date: August 25, 2016

.30/tn per mile w/$3.50 min.

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-17-226J

Special Provision

Haul Price

No Bid

105.00

105.00 No Bid

No Bid

87.50 .20/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.
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Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
N. Little Rock
501-945-7176

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Black Rock, AR
870-878-6307

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Bee Branch
501-745-3693

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Judsonia
501-729-4601

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Luxora
870-658-2543

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR
Paragould
870-573-6882

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR
Tuckerman
870-349-2995

No Bid Received

.30/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

High Performance Cold Mix 
Per Ton Haul PriceBidders

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-17-226J

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2016 thru March 31, 2017                      Opening Date: August 25, 2016

.30/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

90.00 .30/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

90.00 .30/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

105.00

Special Provision

.30/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.

90.00

No Bid

90.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

90.00
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Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO
Gravette, AR
479-298-0052

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO
Monett, MO
417-847-2489

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO
Springdale, AR (Recycle Plant For
Asphalt Shingles & Wrap Only)
417-847-2489

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO
Sonora Plant, Springdale, AR
479-927-0257

JoB Const. Co., Inc.
Poteau , OK 
Poteau 
918-647-8284 

Lehman-Roberts Co. 
Memphis, TN
2360 West Belmont Circle, Memphis
901-327-3595

Lehman-Roberts Co. 
2840 Carrier Rd. 
Memphis, TN
901-345-3826

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY
** See Attached Sheet for Haul Rate

**

**

High Performance Cold Mix 
Per Ton

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2016 thru March 31, 2017                      Opening Date: August 25, 2016

125.00 No Bid

No Bid Received

Haul Price

Special Provision

*

High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-17-226J

Bidders

*

108.00 .19/tn per mile

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

105.00

*
105.00

105.00 **

No Bid Received
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Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.
Pine Bluff, AR
Monticello
870-534-7120

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.
Pine Bluff, AR
Kansas Street & River 
Pine Bluff
870-534-7120

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR
Greenbrier
501-679-6230

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR
Cabot, AR - Hwy 5 North
501-843-5154

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

110.00

100.00 .30/tn per mile w/$3.50 min.                 
Full Load Only

*

No Bid Received

104.00

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2016 thru March 31, 2017                      Opening Date: August 25, 2016

*

Haul PriceBidders

Special Provision

.25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.                 
Full Load Only

.25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min.                 
Full Load Only

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-17-226J

High Performance Cold Mix 
Per Ton
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Date of Contract:  October 1, 2016 thru March 31, 2017                      Opening Date: August 25, 2016

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-17-226J


	Plant Mix Contract

