
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-17-035J DATE OPENED:  3/14/2017

               FOB:  PAGE:  1 of 2
DELIVERY:   Prairie (2),Lonoke (3) & Pulaski Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

162,886.50 254,391.30 176,537.05

143,193.50 70,117.05 19,022.60

CARD: 05-06
DATE:  3/28/2017

ITEM(S):  3, 6, 7 & 8 Only

ITEM(S):  1, 2, 5 & 9 Only

ITEM(S):  4 OnlyAWARDED TO: Rogers Group, Inc.

4. 838 Lonoke Co., Hwy 67 23.50

1. 910 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 222

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
AHTD - TABULATION

(D-6) -  Hot Spring (2), Saline,

BIDDING:  

ALL OR NONE:  
Blake Lanier  PH: 870-799-2338

DESCRIPTION

Mineral Aggregate Class 2 

Within 60 days from date of award
Quality Trucking
P O Box 242629
Little Rock, AR  72223
Rick Ward  PH:  501-661-8114

Bradley Contracting
500 Bradley Lane
Cord, AR  72524

19,693.00              

23.50 31,020.00              26.75 35,310.00              

25.30

28.95                26,344.50              No Bid

23.50 23,500.00              

No Bid 25.30

63,385.60              

25.15

23.50 25.6058,186.00              

25.95

No Bid

21,201.40              

25,150.00              7. 1,000 Lonoke Co., Hwy 236

Saline Co., I-30 No Bid 24.75 15,345.00              

Lonoke Co., Hwy 31

2. 620

Pulaski Co., Hwy 10

6. 2,476

3. 1,320 Prairie Co., Hwy 38

28.95

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

TOTAL:

No Bid9. 305

8. 39,227.25              

Rogers Group, Inc.

1,355 Prairie Co., Hwy 38

19,506.30              5. 771

34,254.00              

No Bid

No Bid

22.70 19,022.60              

24.85 24,850.00              

1223 Front Street
Conway, AR  72032
Mike Knight  PH:  501-339-6521

24.45 60,538.20              

27.95 37,872.25              22.50 30,487.50              

AWARDED TO:

AWARDED TO:

Purchasing Committee

Bradley Contracting

Quality Trucking

No Bid

AWARDED BY:

Hot Spring Co., Hwy 222 29.25 8,921.25                



DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-17-035J DATE OPENED:  3/14/2017

               FOB:  PAGE:  2 of 2
DELIVERY:   Prairie (2),Lonoke (3) & Pulaski Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

125,516.00TOTAL:

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

9. 305 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 222 No Bid

8. 1,355 Prairie Co., Hwy 38 No Bid

7. 1,000 Lonoke Co., Hwy 236 25.50 25,500.00              

6. 2,476 Lonoke Co., Hwy 31 26.00 64,376.00              

5. 771 Pulaski Co., Hwy 10 No Bid

4. 838 Lonoke Co., Hwy 67 No Bid

3. 1,320 Prairie Co., Hwy 38 27.00 35,640.00              

2. 620 Saline Co., I-30 No Bid

1. 910 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 222 No Bid

ALL OR NONE:  

BIDDING:  
DESCRIPTION

P O Box 166
Carlisle, AR  72024
 T J Pauschert  PH:  870-552-9400

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
AHTD - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 2 

(D-6) -  Hot Spring (2), Saline,
Within 60 days from date of award

T J Pauschert Trucking


	Short Tab

