
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev.  3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-17-037J DATE OPENED:  3/14/2017

PAGE:  1
DELIVERY:  

Arkansas Quality Stone Capital Quarries
P O Box 186 632 Johnson Church Road
Ash Flat, AR  72513 Pocahontas, AR  72455

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

Purchasing Committee Date 3/28/2017 Card No. 05-10
Bradley Contracting ITEM(S) 2 & 5-14 Only
Arkansas Quality Stone (4/6/2017) ITEM(S) 1, 3 & 4 Only

26,247.95            

AWARDED BY:
AWARDED TO:

TOTAL: 144,465.96         

116,724.20         RECOMMENDED AWARD:

50,930.47            

13. 931 Randolph Co., Hwy 304N 12.00 11,172.00           No Bid

14. 284 Randolph Co., Hwy 304N 12.00 3,408.00             No Bid

12. 510 Mississippi Co., Hwy 150 20.28 10,342.80           No Bid

11. 371 Mississippi Co., Hwy 14 20.28 7,523.88             No Bid

10. 696 Craighead Co., E. Hinkley St. 14.00 9,744.00             14.82 10,314.72            

4. 722 Greene Co., Hwy 141

Bradley Contracting

No Bid

1. 513 Craighead Co., Hwy 63

3.

9,530.40              

2. 473

14.00                7,182.00             

Clay Co., Hwy 211 15.95 7,544.35             

12.85                6,592.05              

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
AHTD - TABULATION

BIDDING:  

ALL OR NONE:  

DESCRIPTION

Mineral Aggregate Class 4

500 Bradley Lane
Cord, AR  72524
Blake Lanier  PH:  870-799-2338

   FOB:  (D-10) - Craighead (2), Clay (2), Greene (2), 
Within 60 days from date of award              Mississippi (4), Poinsett & Randolph (3) Co.

333

13.78 10,610.60           

13.78 9,949.16             

770 Greene Co., Hwy 141

5,877.45              

20.28

Poinsett Co., Hwy 149

9,837.50             

15.80 5,261.40             

Mississippi Co., Hwy 148

No Bid

No Bid

684 Mississippi Co., Hwy 61

19,570.20           

15.31 18,448.55           

8. 787 Randolph Co., Hwy 328

6. 965

Reggie Holland  PH:  870-243-8671

No Bid

17.95 8,490.35              

13.15

13.20

Doug Gill  PH:  870-994-7775

10,125.50            

 Reject - No Bid Bond 

TENATIVE AWARD TO:

Clay Co., Hwy 90

12.50

9. 17.65

5.

7. 1,205

20.28 13,871.52           


	Short Tab

