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BID NO.:  M-17-040J DATE OPENED:  3/14/2017

PAGE:  1 of 2
DELIVERY:  

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

125,483.00 237,482.50 19,720.00

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 125,483.00 24,800.00 19,720.00
Purchasing Committee DATE:  CARD: 05-05

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

AWARDED BY:  

North Central Arkansas Quarry, Inc. 5 Only
L & N Quarry 10 Only
B.L.K Quarries 9 Only

FOB: (D-5) -  Fulton, Cleburne (2), Independence, 
Within 60 day from date of award Izard (2), Jackson (2), Sharp, Stone & White Co. (2)

19,720.00            

No Bid

No Bid

23.20

400 Jackson Co., Hwy 37

No Bid 23,502.50            

24,300.00            

10,800.00            

North Central Arkansas Quarry, Inc.
P O Box 1570

No Bid

14,400.00            

Mountain Home, AR  72654-1570

Midwest Lime Company

28.10 12,645.00            

21,080.00            

1 Only

16,983.00            

24.80

No Bid

No Bid

17,200.00            

Bradley Contracting

16,150.00            

2-4, 6-8, 11 & 12 Only
3/28/2017

No Bid

19.00

11. 850 White Co.,  Hwy 11 19.98

White Co.,  Hwy 11

TOTAL:

12. 850

10. 450

22.50

20.50Izard Co.,  Hwy 56

Cleburne Co., Hwy 263

5.

No Bid

Cleburne Co.,  Hwy 210 No Bid 25.25

Stone Co.,  Hwy 263

28.55

30,375.00            No Bid25.25 34,087.50            

14,025.00            

17,360.00            

16.50 No Bid20.40 17,340.00            

24.80 No Bid14,350.00            

500 Bradley Lane P O Box 2608

DESCRIPTION

No Bid

Blake Lanier  PH:  870-799-2338 Barry Ferrell  PH:  870-793-2317

No Bid

Bradley Contracting

DESCRIPTION:

BIDDING:  
ALL OR NONE:  

Batesville, AR  72503Cord, AR  72524

Midwest Lime Company

1. 1,000 Fulton Co., Hwy 289

2. 1,350

Mike Dilbeck  PH:  870-424-3839

24.80 24,800.00            

16.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
AHTD - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 1

Sharp Co.,  Hwy 56

24,267.50            

3. 850 Independence Co., Hwy 167

4. 700

No Bid

16.00 6,400.00              

Izard Co., Hwy 177

27.00

27.00

27.65

400 10,100.00            9.

8. 800 16.00 21.5012,800.00            

850

6. 900 Jackson Co., Hwy 37

7.
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B.L.K. Quarries
P O Box 489
Quitman, AR  72131

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 9,900.00              7,908.00              

18,572.50            

TOTAL: 42,300.00            110,401.00          76,855.00            

22.27 18,929.50            21.85

22.35 18,997.50            

12. 850 White Co.,  Hwy 11 No Bid

11,520.00            No Bid

11. 850 White Co.,  Hwy 11 No Bid 22.45 19,082.50            

10. 450 Stone Co.,  Hwy 263 22.00 9,900.00              25.60

Rogers Group, Inc.
P O Box 1045 1223 Front Street

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     

No Bid

9. 400 Cleburne Co.,  Hwy 210 No Bid 19.77 7,908.00              

L & N Quarry

21.60 8,640.00              

No Bid

8. 800 Sharp Co.,  Hwy 56 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

7. 400 Jackson Co., Hwy 37 No Bid No Bid

6. 900 Jackson Co., Hwy 37 No Bid

No Bid

5. 850 Izard Co., Hwy 177 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

4. 700 Izard Co.,  Hwy 56 No Bid No Bid

33,156.00            22.70 30,645.00            

3. 850 Independence Co., Hwy 167 No Bid 23.30 19,805.00            

No Bid No Bid

2. 1,350 Cleburne Co., Hwy 263 24.00 32,400.00            24.56

DESCRIPTION

1. 1,000 Fulton Co., Hwy 289 No Bid

BIDDING:  

Mike Knight  PH:  501-339-6521Bobby Kennedy  PH:  501-589-2133
Conway, AR  72032Mtn. View, AR  72560

Within 60 days from date of award  Izard (2), Jackson (2), Sharp, Stone & White Co. (2)
   FOB: (D-5) -  Fulton, Cleburne (2), Independence,

ALL OR NONE:  

DESCRIPTION:

Flynn Norman  PH:  870-269-4500

AHTD - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 1
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