DESCRIPTION:

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
AHTD - TABULATION

BID NO.:

FOB:

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award

M-17-044J

(D-9) - Benton (2), Madison (2),

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DATE OPENED: 3/14/2017

PAGE: 1of2

Newton & Baxter (3) Co.

APAC-Central, Inc. North Central Arkansas Quarry's Benton County Stone
1010 Frontier Road P O Box 1570 P O Box 988
Barling, AR 72923 Mtn. Home, AR 72654 Pryor, OK 74362
Ted Craft PH: 479-788-6342 Mike Dilbeck PH: 870-424-3839 Jerry A. Arnold PH: 918-825-3370
ALL OR NONE:
BIDDING:
ITEM NO. [ QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 931 |Benton Co., Hwy 72 25.60 23,833.60 No Bid 16.95 15,780.45
2. 1,629 [Madison Co., Hwy 74 23.20 37,792.80 No Bid No Bid
3. 1,385 [Madison Co., Hwy 295 22.50 31,162.50 No Bid No Bid
A) 15,250.00
4. 1,233 [Newton Co., Hwy 374 A)30.50 B)31.95 B) 23,419.35 No Bid No Bid
5. 408 |Baxter Co., Hwy 101 No Bid 22.20 9,057.60 No Bid
6. 475 |Baxter Co., Hwy 201 No Bid 22.20 10,545.00 No Bid
7. 458 |Baxter Co., Hwy 341 No Bid 22.20 10,167.60 No Bid
8. 1,043 [Benton Co., Hwy 94 22.70 23,676.10 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL: 155,134.35 29,770.20 15,780.45
RECOMMENDED AWARD: 131,300.75 29,770.20 15,780.45
AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 3/28/2017 CARD: 05-09
AWARDED TO: APAC - Central, Inc. ITEM(S): 2-4 & 8 Only
AWARDED TO: North Central Arkansas Quarry's ITEM(S): 5-7 Only
AWARDED TO: Benton County Stone ITEM(S): 1 Only




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
AHTD - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017
Mineral Aggregate Class 2 BID NO.: M-17-044J DATE OPENED: 3/14/2017
FOB: (D-9) - Benton (2), Madison (2), PAGE: 2 of 2

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award Newton & Baxter (3) Co.

Hutchens Construction Duffield Gravel Company

1007 Main Street 16 Bluff Drive

Cassville, MO 65625 Russellville, AR 72802

Kayla Ragsdale PH: 417-847-2489 Ronnie Duffield PH: 479-967-5565

ALL OR NONE:
BIDDING:
ITEM NO. | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT |  EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 931 [Benton Co., Hwy 72 24.40 22,716.40 | REJECTED - INSUEFICIENT FUNDS
OF ANNUAL BID & PERFORMANCE
2. 1,629 [Madison Co., Hwy 74 27.55 44,878.95 BONDS ON FILE
3. 1,385 [Madison Co., Hwy 295 26.80 37,118.00
4. 1,233 |Newton Co., Hwy 374 32.22 39,727.26
5. 408 |Baxter Co., Hwy 101 36.70 14,973.60
6. 475 |Baxter Co., Hwy 201 35.50 16,862.50
7. 458 |Baxter Co., Hwy 341 36.55 16,739.90
8. 1,043|Benton Co., Hwy 94 23.05 24,041.15
TOTAL: 217,057.76
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