ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ArDOT TABULATION

DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 6-23-2008
6 Items - Carbide Tipped Snow Plow Blades BID NO.: M-18-012J DATE OPENED: 8/22/2017
FOB: Barling, Harrison & Paragould, AR PAGE: 1of2
DELIVERY: Within 45 days after award
Valk Manufacturing Company Heavyquip Kennametal Inc.
P O Box 428 9701 Meadow Lane 442 Chalybeate Road
New Kingstown, PA 17072 Mabelvale, AR 72103 Bedford, PA 15522
Ted Valk PH: 717-766-0711 Clay Williams PH: 501-455-2596 Cary D. Ritchey PH: 814-623-4472
ALL OR NONE: XXXX XXXX XXXX
BIDDING: Valk Black Cat Kennametal
ITEM NO. [QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 140 [3'x 7/8" x 8" w 5/8" Hole D4 94.77 13,267.80 132.33 18,526.20 198.75 27,825.00
2. 160 [4' x 7/8" x 8" w 5/8" Hole D4 126.26 20,201.60 176.52 28,243.20 248.99 39,838.40
3. 200 |3'x 7/8" x 5" w 3/4" Hole D9 86.34 17,268.00 118.50 23,700.00 162.00 32,400.00
4, 100 [4' x 7/8" x 5" w 3/4" Hole D9 115.12 11,512.00 157.90 15,790.00 175.00 17,500.00
5. 200 |3'x 7/8" x 5" w 5/8" Hole D10 86.34 17,268.00 118.50 23,700.00 108.30 21,660.00
6. 100 [4' x 7/8" x 5" w 5/8" Hole D10 115.12 11,512.00 157.90 15,790.00 138.60 13,860.00
Total: 91,029.40 125,749.40 153,083.40
TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 9/1/2017 CARD: 01-42
AWARDED TO: Valk Manufacturing Company (9/11/2017) ITEM(S): Complete Bid




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ArDOT - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 6-23-2008
6 Items - Carbide Tipped Snow Plow Blades BID NO.: M-18-012J DATE OPENED: 8/22/2017
FOB: Barling, Harrison & Paragould, AR PAGE: 20f2
DELIVERY: within 45 days after award
Winter Equipment Company Nordik Blades
1900 Joseph Lloyd Parkway 451 vae de I'Amiante
Willoughby, OH 44094 Asbestos (Que'bec) Canada JIT4V8
Nate Kallay PH: 800-294-6837 Marco Bergeron PH: 819-879-0047
ALL OR NONE: XXXX XXXX
BIDDING: Winter Equipment Company Nordik
ITEM NO. [QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 140 [3'x 7/8" x 8" w 5/8" Hole D4 218.75 30,625.00 No Bid No Bid
2. 160 [4' x 7/8" x 8" w 5/8" Hole D4 292.00 46,720.00 No Bid No Bid
3. 200 |3'x 7/8" x 5" w 3/4" Hole D9 218.75 43,750.00 103.11 20,622.00
4, 100 [4' x 7/8" x 5" w 3/4" Hole D9 292.00 29,200.00 137.48 13,748.00
5. 200 |3'x 7/8" x 5" w 5/8" Hole D10 218.75 43,750.00 103.11 20,622.00
6. 100 [4' x 7/8" x 5" w 5/8" Hole D10 292.00 29,200.00 137.48 13,748.00
Total: 223,245.00 68,740.00
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