
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-18-033J DATE OPENED:  4/3/2018

               FOB:  PAGE:  1

DELIVERY:          Little River, Miller and Nevada Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

382,772.50 127,520.00

382,772.50 0.00

     TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY: DATE:  CARD: 05-03
ITEM(S):  

1.

3.

2. 1,600

2,000 Lafayette Co., Hwy 53

2,350 Sevier Co., Hwy 24-1

DESCRIPTION

Malvern, AR  72104
271 Catherine Cove Rd.

No Bid

Quality Trucking 
Within 60 days from date of award 

4.

41.75

40.15                

James M. Bozeman, LLC

1,200

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - TABULATION

(D-3) - Sevier, Howard, Lafayette,

BIDDING:  
ALL OR NONE:  

Howard Co., Hwy 371

33.72

Mineral Aggregate Class 1

5. 800

P O Box 242629
Little Rock, AR  72223

36.85

42.30

33.35

39.30

50,760.00              

Rick Ward  PH:  501-661-8114

94,352.50              

6. 2,000 Nevada Co., Hwy 371

4/11/2018
     AWARDED TO:  

TOTAL:

Purchasing Committee

James Bozeman  PH:  501-844-0100

33,400.00              

58,960.00              

Complete Bid

78,600.00              

Little River Co., Hwy 41

66,700.00              

Miller Co., Hwy 134

No Bid

Quality Trucking (4/11/18)

60,080.00                   37.55                

No Bid

67,440.00                   

No Bid

RECOMMENDED AWARD:


	Short Tab

