
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-18-034J DATE OPENED:  4/3/2018

               FOB:  PAGE:  1
DELIVERY:  Scott, Polk and Franklin Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

275,263.75 142,271.76 50,862.55

112,771.40 142,271.76

 TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY      Purchasing Committee DATE:  CARD: 05-04

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

ITEM(S):  

Polk Co., Hwy 8 35.00 33,635.00              

Ted Craft  PH:  479-788-6342

37,600.75              31.15 41,460.65              28.254. 1,331

1. 961 Washington Co., Hwy 170

Scott Co., Hwy 270

3.

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

1,914 Sebastian Co., Hwy 96

DESCRIPTION

Within 60 days from date of award

Jerry A. Arnold  PH:  918-825-3370
Russellville, AR  72802

23,784.75              24.75                

Pryor, OK  74262

APAC - Central, Inc.
755 E. Millsap Rd.

David Duffield  PH:  479-967-5565

River Valley Quarries, LLC
P O Box 988

No Bid

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

(D-4) - Washington (4), Sebastian, 

BIDDING:  

ALL OR NONE:  

Fayetteville, AR  72703

Duffield Gravel Company
16 Bluff Drive

36,793.81              

No Bid

2. 493 Washington Co., Hwy 71 21.00 No Bid10,353.00              No Bid

5. 961

7. 1,109 24.05

51,962.20              

24.20 46,318.80              

APAC - Central, Inc. (4/11/18) 1, 2, 6 & 7 only

Washington Co., Hwy 49

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

8. 1,763 Franklin Co., Hwy 22 23.30

2,108 Washington Co., Hwy 59

41,077.90              

24.656.

20.87

TOTAL:

28.85

No Bid

50,862.55              

26,671.45              No Bid

4/11/2018

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

AWARDED TO:  3, 4, 5 & 8  onlyRiver Valley Quarries, LLC (4/11/18)

20.20 38,662.80              

30.40 29,214.40              

No Bid


	Short Tab

