
Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-18-043J DATE OPENED:  4/10/2018

PAGE:  1 of 2
DELIVERY:  

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

171,962.50 270,013.00 125,107.50          

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 94,371.50
TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY:  DATE:  CARD: 05-05
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

18.08 30,736.00            

19.95 40,897.50            

10.00 20,500.00            

600

6. 1,700 Sharp Co.,  Hwy 56

24.50

27,200.00            

White Co., Hwy 31

16.00

5.

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 1

1. 850 Stone Co., Hwy 263

4. 2,050

2. 1,700

Varand Vartanian  PH:  202-455-8918

34.4035,700.00            

DESCRIPTION:

BIDDING:  
ALL OR NONE:  

Alexandria, VA  22314

Green Dream International
2331 Mill Rd., Suite 100

Independence and Sharp Co.

Batesville, AR  72503

FOB: (D-5) -  Stone, Izard, White (2),
Within 60 day from date of award

22,142.50            

Barry Ferrell  PH:  870-793-2317

DESCRIPTION

21.00 58,480.00            

26.05                22,100.00            26.00                

Midwest Lime Company Bradley Contracting, Inc.
500 Bradley Lane
Cord, AR  72524

29,212.50            

P O Box 2608

Jason Angel  PH:  870-799-2338

25.68

21,148.00            

No Bid

11,826.00            

63,939.50            

2,050 White Co., Hwy 36 43,050.00            21.00 52,644.00            

31.1914.25Independence Co., Hwy 69

Izard Co., Hwy 354

4/20/2018

TOTAL:

3.

Arkansas Quality Stone (5/1/18)

Bradley Contracting, Inc. (4/20/18) 3-6 only
1 only

19.71

12.4433.33

Purchasing Committee

L & N Quarry, Inc. (4/20/18)
2 only

14,700.00            16,146.00            

56,661.00            

26.91



Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-18-043J DATE OPENED:  4/10/2018

PAGE:  2 of 2
DELIVERY:  

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

15,300.00 28,900.00

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 15,300.00 28,900.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     

TOTAL:

No Bid

6. 1,700 Sharp Co.,  Hwy 56 No Bid No Bid

5. 600 White Co., Hwy 31 No Bid

No Bid

4. 2,050 Independence Co., Hwy 69 No Bid

No Bid

BIDDING:  

No Bid

17.00 28,900.00            

3. 2,050 White Co., Hwy 36 No Bid

1. 850 Stone Co., Hwy 263 18.00 15,300.00            

DESCRIPTION

Flynn Norman  PH:  870-269-4500 Doug Gill  PH:  870-994-7775
Mtn. View, AR  72560

ARDOT - TABULATION

Within 60 day from date of award Independence and Sharp Co.

Ash Flat, AR  72513
P O Box 1045

Arkansas Quality Stone
P O Box 186

FOB: (D-5) -  Stone, Izard, White (2),

L & N Quarry, Inc.

2. 1,700 Izard Co., Hwy 354 No Bid

Mineral Aggregate Class 1

DESCRIPTION:

ALL OR NONE:  
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