
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-18-048J DATE OPENED:  5/8/2018

PAGE:  1
DELIVERY:  

Green Dream International, LLC
2331 Mill Rd., Suite 100
Alexandria, VA 22314

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 5/29/2018 CARD: 05-01

AWARDED TO: Quality Trucking (5/29/18) ITEM(S)

AWARDED TO: ITEM(S)

5.

4. 1,200

6.

7.

1-3, 8 & 9, 11 & 12 only

Monroe Co., Hwy 238 45.60 54,720.00           No Bid

No Bid

61.80 30,900.00           Phillips Co., Hwy 85

No Bid

No Bid

TOTAL: 545,290.00         

St. Francis Co., Hwy 306

250

500

1,150 30.56 35,144.00               

24.35                19,480.00               

PH: 202-455-5982 (Varand Vartanian)

171,067.00             

58,650.00           

56.40 81,780.00           25.41                36,844.50               

14.

8.

10.

9.

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

BIDDING:  

ALL OR NONE:  

DESCRIPTION

Mineral Aggregate Class 4

P.O. Box 242629
Little Rock, AR 72223
PH: 501-661-8114 (Rick Ward)

           FOB:  (D-1) - Crittenden (3), Cross (2)
Within 60 days from date of award Monroe (2), (Phillips (2), St. Francis (3) and Lee (2) Co.

Quality Trucking

210,580.00         

19,810.00               

19,390.00           

35,230.00           

55.20

RECOMMENDED AWARD:

171,067.00             

650

55.40 28.30

28.30

50.80

55.40

Crittenden Co., Hwy 184350

Lee Co., Hwy 78 47.40 30,810.00           

11.

13. 650

38,780.00           

33,020.00           

9,905.00                 

650

2. 1,050 Cross Co., Hwy 42 56.00 58,800.00           28.59                30,019.50               

1. 1,450 Crittenden Co., Hwy 50

48.00 12,000.00           

55.60 13,900.00           

Monroe Co., Hwy 49

51.00St. Francis Co., Hwy 306

Phillips Co., Hwy 20 Spur

44,160.00           

250

Green Dream International, LLC (6/19/18)

4-7, 10, 13 & 14 only

3. 800 Crittenden Co., Hwy 38

No Bid

12. 700 Cross Co., Hwy 184

Lee Co., Hwy 44 at CR 225

19,864.00               30.5651.00

St. Francis Co., Hwy 149 No Bid

No Bid

54.20

33,150.00           650


	Short Tab

