
Date of Contract:   December 1, 2018 thru November 30, 2019                               Opening Date:  October 16, 2018

ITEM 1A ITEM 1B ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8 ITEM 9 ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13A ITEM 13B ITEM 14A ITEM 14B
MSMA MSMA Roundup Surfactant Drift Krenite S Escort Telar Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method
(gal.) (gal.) Custom (gal.) Control (gal.) XP XP PRO-CON. (gal.) (oz.) (gal.) EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL

In 15 gal. (gal.) Agent (oz.) (oz.) (gal.)   (gal.) (qt.) (gal.) (qt.) (gal.)
Returnable (qt.)  

Helena Agri - Enterprises, LLC
121 Seneca Court 20.50 24.75 16.00 *17.00 *16.00 61.76 2.17 11.77 15.75 58.00 13.60 109.50 42.84 309.76 1113.60 91.52 318.72
Pineville, LA  71360
870-946-3516, Bob Hynum
Red River Specialties, LLC.
1324 North Hearne Ave -Ste 120 28.00 30.76 16.86 9.25 8.32 63.77 2.70 12.96 15.96 52.29 14.68 *105.55 36.95 309.76 1113.60 91.52 318.72
Shreveport, LA  71107
1-870-260-0795 Kevin Tucker
Nutrien AG Solutions, Inc.
169 Joe Phillips Rd. Lot # 2 20.75 28.30 15.70 9.90 9.00 64.80 2.10 11.15 15.05 47.60 13.60 105.98 36.60 309.76 1113.60 91.52 318.72
De Ridder, LA  70634
337-200-1407 Tim Roark
ChemTrade Turf, LLC
P O Box 16837 25.21 No Bid 20.35 14.95 21.45 89.93 5.78 19.99 23.82 82.50 16.96 148.50 47.58 361.90 1336.50 110.00 361.68
Jonesboro, AR  72403
870-268-6775 Nick Williams or Jan Roberts

VM  Distribution Partners
a Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co No Bid No Bid 16.83 9.90 12.10 63.39 2.07 12.19 16.39 47.89 13.65 103.59 42.29 309.76 1113.60 91.52 318.72
110 West College Street
Marshall, AR  72650
870-448-5414 George Phillips or Lowell Stivison

code: 06-00
Denotes - Award To Low Bidder *Low Bid meeting Specs. Tie Bid - Awarded by Lot    

 
Tentatively Awarded By:                         Purchasing Committee Date:  

Awarded To:  Red River Specialties, LLC. (11/1/2018)
Awarded To:  VM Distribution Partners  (11/13/2018)
Awarded To:  Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC. (11/14/2018)
Awarded To:  Nutrien AG Solutions, Inc. (11/26/2018)

11/1/2018
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Arkansas State Highway Commission
ARDOT - Tabulation for H-19-220J - Vegetation Control Materials

STATEWIDE

ALL OR NONE ALL OR NONE

Tie Bid awarded to "Arkansas Company" in accordance with 
Arkansas Procurement Law (R7:19-11-229)



Date of Contract:   December 1, 2018 thru November 30, 2019 Opening Date:  October 16, 2018

ITEM 1A ITEM 1B ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8 ITEM 9 ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13A ITEM 13B ITEM 14A ITEM 14B
MSMA MSMA Roundup Surfactant Drift Krenite S Escort Telar Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method
(gal.) (gal.) Custom (gal.) Control (gal.) XP XP PRO-CON. (oz.) (gal.) EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL

In 15 gal. (gal.) (qt.) (oz.) (oz.) (gal.) (gal.)   (gal.) (qt.) (gal.) (qt.) (gal.)
Returnable  

Helena Agri - Enterprises, LLC
121 Seneca Court Target 6 Target 6 Roundup Induce Ground Zero Krenite S Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method 
Pineville, LA  71360 Plus Plus Custom PRO-CON. EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL
870-946-3516, Bob Hynum
Red River Specialties, LLC.
1324 North Hearne Ave -Ste 120 MSMA MSMA Roundup RRSI Elite Krenite S Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method
Shreveport, LA  71107 6.0 6.0 Custom NIS Secure Ultra PRO-CON. Herbicide EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL
1-870-260-0795 Kevin Tucker
Nutrien AG Solutions, Inc.
169 Joe Phillips Rd. Lot # 2 Target 6 MSMA Roundup Brewer Reign LC Krenite S Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method
De Ridder, LA  70634 Plus 6 Plus Custom 90110 PRO-CON. EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL
337-200-1407 Tim Roark
ChemTrade Turf, LLC
P O Box 16837 MSMA No Bid Red River Kabak Max Krenite S Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Arsenal Outrider Plateau EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method
Jonesboro, AR  72403 6 Plus 90 PRO-CON. EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL
870-268-6775 Nick Williams or Jan Roberts

VM  Distribution Partners
a Division of Asplundh Tree Expert Co.
110 West College Street No Bid No Bid Roundup Alligare 90 Alligare Drift Krenite S Escort XP Telar XP Roundup Ecomazapyr Outrider Panoramic EsplAnade EsplAnade EsplAnade Method Method
Marshall, AR  72650 Custom Control PRO-CON. 2SL 2SL EZ 200 SC 200 SC 240SL 240SL
870-448-5414 George Phillips or Lowell Stivison

ALL OR NONE ALL OR NONE

List of Vegetation Control Chemicals By Trade Name and Manufacturer Provided by Vendors
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