ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION:

Mineral Aggregate Class 2 BID NO.:

FOB: (D-10) - Craighead, Greene, Randolph(2),

M-19-026J

DATE OPENED:

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award
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Lawrence(2), Clay(2), Poinsett & Mississippi(2) Co.

Bradley Contracting, Inc. Capital Quarries Co., Inc. Arkansas Quality Stone
500 Bradley Lane 632 Johnson Church Rd. P O Box 186
Cord, AR 72524 Pocahontas, AR 72455 Ash Flat, AR 72513
Jason Angel PH: 870-799-2338 Justin Simpson PH: 870-819-6926 Doug Gill PH: 870-994-7775
ALL OR NONE:
QUARRY/PIT: |Bradley Contracting - Cord, AR Capital Quarries -Pocohontas, AR |Arkansas Quality Stone -Ctry Heritage
ITEM NO. | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 1,650 |Craighead Co., Hwy 63 13.30 21,945.00 14.40 23,760.00 No Bid
2. 1,150 (Greene Co., Hwy 412 24.42 28,083.00 18.15 20,872.50 No Bid
3. 1,000 |Randolph Co., Hwy 93 20.20 20,200.00 13.65 13,650.00 21.00 21,000.00
4. 800 [Lawrence Co., Hwy 361 9.54 7,632.00 13.90 11,120.00 20.50 16,400.00
5. 800 [Clay Co., Hwy 90 24,11 19,288.00 19.20 15,360.00 No Bid
6. 250 [Clay Co., Hwy 90 24,11 6,027.50 19.20 4,800.00 No Bid
7. 1,600|Poinsett Co., Hwy 214 18.69 29,904.00 22.45 35,920.00 No Bid
8. 1,900 |Mississippi Co., Hwy 120 23.02 43,738.00 26.65 50,635.00 No Bid
9. 1,200 [Mississippi Co., Hwy 77 21.33 25,596.00 22.35 26,820.00 No Bid
10. 650 |Lawrence Co., Hwy 361 12.38 8,047.00 15.65 10,172.50 No Bid
11. 600 |Randolph Co., Hwy 166 19.57 11,742.00 13.65 8,190.00 No Bid
TOTAL: 222,202.50 221,300.00 37,400.00
RECOMMENDED AWARD: 136,862.00 62,872.50
TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 2/22/2019 CARD: 05-10
AWARDED TO: Bradley Contracting, Inc. ITEM(S) 1,4,7-10 only
AWARDED TO: Capital Quarries Co., Inc. (2/26/2019) ITEM(S) 2,3,5 6&11only
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