DESCRIPTION:
Mineral Aggregate Class 4

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

ARDOT - TABULATION

BID NO.:

M-19-027J

FOB: (D-2) - Ashley, Chicot(2), Drew,

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award

Grant & Jefferson(3) Co.
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J & K Transport, Inc. Quality Trucking Green Dream International, LLC
1599 E. US 278 Hwy P.O. Box 242629 2331 Mill Rd., Suite 100
Hampton, AR 71744 Little Rock, AR 72223 Alexandria, VA 22314
PH: 870-798-3758 (Joey Blann) PH: 501-661-8114 (Rick Ward) PH: 202-470-4600 (Varand Vartanian)
ALL OR NONE:
QUARRY/PIT: |Granite Mountain Quarries Granite Mountain Quarries Granite Mountain Quarries
QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 1,050|Ashley Co., Hwy 133 47.50 49,875.00 52.75 55,387.50 53.71 56,395.50
2. 650 [Chicot Co., Hwy 160 48.50 31,525.00 54.75 35,587.50 No Bid
3. 325 [Chicot Co., Hwy 257 47.50 15,437.50 51.95 16,883.75 No Bid
4. 225 [Drew Co., Hwy 83 41.50 9,337.50 47.25 10,631.25 No Bid
5. 675 |[Grant Co., Hwy 270 36.75 24,806.25 40.10 27,067.50 38.31 25,859.25
6. 425 |Jefferson Co., Hwy 11 40.50 17,212.50 43.25 18,381.25 No Bid
7. 1,375 |Jefferson Co., Hwy 88 37.50 51,562.50 41.90 57,612.50 41.20 56,650.00
8. 1,125|Jefferson Co., Hwy 79 37.50 42,187.50 41.00 46,125.00 41.20 46,350.00
TOTAL: 241,943.75 267,676.25 185,254.75
AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 2/22/2019 CARD: 05-02
AWARDED TO: J & K Transport, Inc. ITEM(S) Complete Bid
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