ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

DESCRIPTION:

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award

ARDOT - TABULATION

BID NO.:

FOB:

M-19-028J

(D-4) - Logan, Franklin, Sebastian,

DATE OPENED:

Polk and Washington Co.

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

2/26/2019

PAGE: 1of2

APAC - Central, Inc. River Valley Quarries Duffield Gravel Company
1010 Frontier Rd. 1050 E. 520 Road 16 Bluff Drive
Barling, AR 72923 Pryor, OK 74361 Russellville, AR 72802
Ted Craft PH: 479-788-6342 Jerry Arnold PH: 918-825-3370 David Duffield PH: 479-967-5565
ALL OR NONE:
SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:|APAC - Central - Preston & Sharps River Valley Quarries-Greenwood/Backbone |Duffield Gravel -South New Hope & Gum Log
ITEM NO. | QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1. 2,333 |Logan Co., Hwy 23 24.65 57,508.45 25.56 59,631.48 30.99 72,299.67
2. 1,440 [Franklin Co., Hwy 22 21.70 31,248.00 22.37 32,212.80 29.70 42,768.00
3. 1,309 [Sebastian Co., Hwy 10 21.70 28,405.30 22.87 29,936.83 No Bid
4, 1,943 [Polk Co., Hwy 88 34.30 66,644.90 35.00 68,005.00 No Bid
5. 2,343 |Washington Co., Hwy 265 25.75 60,332.25 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL: 244,138.90 189,786.11 115,067.67
RECOMMENDED AWARD: 244,138.90
AWARDED BY: Purchasing Committee DATE: 3/4/2019 CARD: 05-04
AWARDED TO: APAC - Central, Inc. ITEM(S): Complete Bid




ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017
Mineral Aggregate Class 2 BID NO.: M-19-028J DATE OPENED: 2/26/2019
FOB: (D-4) - Logan, Franklin, Sebastian, PAGE: 20f 2
DELIVERY: Within 60 days from date of award Polk and Washington Co.
Rock-it Natural Stone, Inc.
P O Box 410

Wister, OK 724966
Lydia Baldwin PH: 800-371-4219

ALL OR NONE:
SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:
ITEM NO. [ QTY. DESCRIPTION |

1. 2,333 |Logan Co., Hwy 23 Rejected - No Bid Bond
2. 1,440 |Franklin Co., Hwy 22
3. 1,309 |Sebastian Co., Hwy 10
4. 1,943 |Polk Co., Hwy 88
5. 2,343 |Washington Co., Hwy 265

TOTAL:
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