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234,996.16 263,215.90 275,693.76

 AWARDED BY:  DATE:  CARD: 05-06
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

Purchasing Committee

Duffield Gravel Company 1 only

38.34

34.50

12,782.00            

569

41.50

21.03

1,312 Garland Co., Hwy 7

8,534.24              

6. 822 Lonoke Co., Hwy 167/67

7.

8. 308

656              21,877.60 9.

4. 373

41.50 47,434.50            

Lonoke Co., Hwy 38

35.25

719 Lonoke Co., Hwy 13 28.50

Hot Spring Co., Hwy 7

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 2

Hot Spring Co., Hwy 128

1.

2.

Granite Mtn. Quarries -Bryant & Dixon Rd.

33.4819,552.50            

36.60                

23,804.28            

             48,019.20 

             23,676.30 

Bradley Contracting, Inc.

Little Rock, AR  72223Cord, AR  72524

711

Rick Ward  PH:  501-661-8114

55,760.00            42.50                

Lonoke Co., Hwy 165 33.30                

DESCRIPTION:

SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:
ALL OR NONE:  

Bradley Contracting - Cord

P O Box 242629500 Bradley Lane
Quality Trucking

FOB: (D-6) -  Garland, Lonoke (6), Prairie
Within 60 day from date of award

33.48

DESCRIPTION
Granite Mtn. Quarries

40.50                53,136.00            

Jason Angel  PH:  870-799-2338

22.31

Varand Vartanian  PH:  202-470-4600

5.

3. 986 Lonoke Co., Hwy 31

10.

21,997.66            

Lonoke Co., Hwy 13 28.50 18,696.00            

1,143

22,671.36            

34.56

22.88Prairie Co., Co. Court Annex

28,852.20            

21.90

17,286.66            

7 & 8 only

20,491.50            

MillWright Construction
Rogers Group, Inc.

3/4/2019

TOTAL:

37.26             10,857.00 

2-6, 9 & 10 only

24,848.64            

34.5633.35

33.35

11,476.08            

             23,978.65 

             41,090.85 

33.50

43,822.62            

35.10

             27,701.40 

             33,031.00 

35.80 14,099.40            

33.70

35.95

2331 Mill Rd., Suite 100

33,011.28            

37.80

Hot Spring (2) Co.

12,461.10                         19,630.50 19,971.90            

             13,353.40 

Green Dream International

Alexandria, VA  22314

27.50

35.10



Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017
BID NO.:  M-19-032J DATE OPENED:  2/26/2019

PAGE:  2 of 3
DELIVERY:  

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

100,160.80 97,071.34 40,672.00

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 100,160.80 48,920.94 40,672.00

22.60                

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION:
Mineral Aggregate Class 2

FOB: (D-6) -  Garland, Lonoke (6), Prairie
Within 60 day from date of award Hot Spring (2) Co.

Rogers Group, Inc. MillWright Construction Duffield Gravel Company
1223 Front Street P O Box 20234 16 Bluff Drive
Conway, AR  72032 Hot Springs, AR  71903 Russellville, AR  72802
Mike Knight  PH:  501-339-6521 Ray Dillard  PH:  501-701-9232 David Duffield  PH:  479-967-5565

ALL OR NONE:  
SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT: Rogers Group - Cabot Granite Mtn. Quarries - Bryant/Bauxite Duffield Gravel  - South New Hope/Gum Log
DESCRIPTION

1. 1,312 Garland Co., Hwy 7  No Bid 36.70                48,150.40            31.00                40,672.00            

2. 711 Lonoke Co., Hwy 165              16,068.60 No Bid No Bid

3. 986 Lonoke Co., Hwy 31 18.70              18,438.20 No Bid No Bid

4. 373 Prairie Co., Co. Court Annex 22.60                8,429.80 No Bid No Bid

5. 569 Lonoke Co., Hwy 38 18.70              10,640.30 No Bid No Bid

6. 822 Lonoke Co., Hwy 167/67 18.70              15,371.40 No Bid No Bid

7. 1,143 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 7  No Bid 33.90 38,747.70            No Bid

8. 308 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 128  No Bid 33.03 10,173.24            No Bid

9. 656 Lonoke Co., Hwy 13 22.70              14,891.20 No Bid

10. 719 Lonoke Co., Hwy 13 22.70              16,321.30 

No Bid

No Bid

TOTAL:

No Bid
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TOTAL:

10. 719 Lonoke Co., Hwy 13

9. 656 Lonoke Co., Hwy 13

8. 308 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 128

7. 1,143 Hot Spring Co., Hwy 7

6. 822 Lonoke Co., Hwy 167/67

5. 569 Lonoke Co., Hwy 38

4. 373 Prairie Co., Co. Court Annex

3. 986 Lonoke Co., Hwy 31

2. 711 Lonoke Co., Hwy 165

DESCRIPTION

1. 1,312 Garland Co., Hwy 7

ALL OR NONE:  
SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:

Wister, OK  74966
Lydia Baldwin  PH:  800-371-4219

Within 60 day from date of award Hot Spring (2) Co.
Rock-It Natural Stone, Inc.
P O Box 410

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

DESCRIPTION:
Mineral Aggregate Class 2

FOB: (D-6) -  Garland, Lonoke (6), Prairie

Reject - No Bid Bond
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