
Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-19-033J DATE OPENED:  2/26/2019

PAGE:  1 of 2
DELIVERY:  

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

172,257.50 201,175.00 10,450.00

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 139,387.50 18,750.00 10,450.00
 AWARDED BY:  DATE:  CARD: 05-05
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  
AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

Purchasing Committee

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

550

6. 750 White Co., Hwy 13 4-A

7.

24.65

19,312.50         

Stone Co., Hwy 263 1-A

25.75

5.

1,950 White Co., Hwy 305

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 1

1. 2,350 Fulton Co., Hwy 223 2-A

4. 850

2. 1,450

Barry Ferrell  PH:  870-793-2317

Midwest Lime - Batesville

13.2516,820.00         

DESCRIPTION:

SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:
ALL OR NONE:  

Bradley Contracting - Cord 

Batesville, AR  72503

Midwest Lime Co.
P O Box 2608

Sharp, Stone and White (2) Co.

Cord, AR  72524

FOB: (D-5) -  Fulton, Independence, Izard,
Within 60 day from date of award

60,512.50         

Jason Angel  PH:  870-799-2338

DESCRIPTION

11.60 19,212.50         

25.75                47,587.50         20.25

L & N Quarry, Inc.
P O Box 1045
Mtn. View, AR  72560

12,197.50         

500 Bradley Lane

16.50

Flynn Norman  PH:  870-269-4500

32,175.00         

No Bid

10,450.00         19.00

Bradley Contracting, Inc.

No Bid

L & N Quarry - Powell/Newnata

24.5030,607.50         18.55 40,425.00         

15.00

Independence Co., Hwy 230 O-A

3/4/2019

TOTAL:

3. 1,650 Izard Co., Hwy 9 12-A

1-4 & 7 only
6 only

14.35Sharp Co., Hwy 167 19-A 12,750.00         

25.00

5 only

13,557.50         

L & N Quarry, Inc.

Bradley Contracting, Inc.

17.50

Midwest Lime Co.

15,400.00         

18,750.00         

34,125.00         

28.00

No Bid
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ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     

TOTAL:

7. 1,950 White Co., Hwy 305

6. 750 White Co., Hwy 13 4-A

5. 550 Stone Co., Hwy 263 1-A

4. 850 Sharp Co., Hwy 167 19-A

3. 1,650 Izard Co., Hwy 9 12-A

1. 2,350 Fulton Co., Hwy 223 2-A  Reject - No Bid Bond 

DESCRIPTION

Chad R. Smith  PH:  870-321-7005
ALL OR NONE:  

SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:

Mtn. Home, AR  72653

ARDOT - TABULATION

Within 60 day from date of award Sharp, Stone and White (2) Co.

40 Plaza Way #8

FOB: (D-5) -  Fulton, Independence, Izard,

Elizabeth Quarry

2. 1,450 Independence Co., Hwy 230 O-A

Mineral Aggregate Class 1

DESCRIPTION:
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