
DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

BID NO.:  M-19-037J DATE OPENED:  3/12/2019

PAGE:  1 of 2
DELIVERY:  Faulkner, Montgomery, Perry, Johnson & Pope Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

246,857.55 304,421.08            331,835.40

RECOMMENDED AWARD: 129,034.17 51,481.04
TENTATIVELY AWARDED BY:  DATE:  CARD: 05-08

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

AWARDED TO:  ITEM(S):  

49.14

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.

Rock-It Natural Stone, Inc. (4/8/2019)

66,484.80              46.98 67,651.20              

4, 11 & 12 only

9 only

1,440 Conway Co., Hwy 124

Van Buren Co., Hwy 254 No Bid11. 1,216

12.

No Bid 59,754.24              

46.9814,396.00              

Faulkner Co., Hwy 310

29.50

35.56

41.40                

38.60

21,983.40              

4. 407

2. 488 Conway Co., Hwy 154

1. 531

Within 60 days from date of award

ALL OR NONE:  

Russellville, AR  72802
David Duffield  PH:  479-967-5565

Duffield Gravel Company

3. 426 Van Buren Co., Hwy 16

DESCRIPTION

31.85

SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT:

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 4

             FOB:  (D-8) -  Yell, Conway (4), Van Buren (2)

Lydia Baldwin  PH:  800-371-4219

P O Box 410
Wister, OK  74966

16 Bluff Drive

Rock-It Natural Stone - Ozark

Alexandria, VA  22314
Varand Vartanian  PH:  202-470-4600

Granite Mtn. Quarries - Sweet HomeDuffield Gravel - S. New Hope/Gum Log

Rock-It Natural Stone, Inc.

22,926.24              

No Bid

16,912.35              

Green Dream International
2331 Mill Rd., Suite 100

15,148.56              50.86 21,666.36              

Yell Co., Hwy 309 51.30 27,240.30              

8,640.00                27.005. 320

18,836.80              

21,115.16              No Bid

53.46

27.006. 285

Conway Co., Hwy 9

Conway Co., Hwy 9 7,695.00                41.66

24,368.32              Montgomery Co., Hwy 240

43.74

TOTAL:

48,308.40              10. 1,260

50,673.60              35.19 46.17

1,678 Johnson Co., Hwy 21 30.99

8. 601 Perry Co., Hwy 9 34.50

9.

41.66 13,331.20              13,996.80              

12,465.90              

30.68 51,481.04              

41.5848.82

11,873.10              43.74

1, 2, 5-8 & 10 only

Purchasing Committee 3/27/2019

Duffield Gravel Company

44.82

44.96542

52,001.22              

20,734.50              

Pope Co., Hwy 105 28.80

17,362.62              42.6651.88

No Bid

28,975.32              

36,288.00              38.34

29,340.82              

7. No Bid

56,473.20              

24,989.58              



DESCRIPTION: Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017
BID NO.:  M-19-037J DATE OPENED:  3/12/2019

PAGE:  2 of 2
DELIVERY:  Faulkner, Montgomery, Perry, Johnson & Pope Co.

ITEM NO. QTY. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

177,414.75
RECOMMENDED AWARD: 99,597.80

TOTAL:

12. 1,440 Conway Co., Hwy 124 32.00 46,080.00              

11. 1,216 Van Buren Co., Hwy 254 33.10 40,249.60              

10. 1,260 Pope Co., Hwy 105 35.20 44,352.00              

9. 1,678 Johnson Co., Hwy 21 No Bid

8. 601 Perry Co., Hwy 9 No Bid

7. 542 Montgomery Co., Hwy 240 No Bid

5. 320 Conway Co., Hwy 9 32.72 10,470.40              

4. 407 Faulkner Co., Hwy 310 32.60 13,268.20              

3. 426 Van Buren Co., Hwy 16 31.80 13,546.80              

No Bid

2. 488 Conway Co., Hwy 154 No Bid

DESCRIPTION

1.

6. 285 Conway Co., Hwy 9 33.15 9,447.75                

531 Yell Co., Hwy 309

11719 Hwy 412 West

SUPPLY QUARRY/PIT: Delta Asphalt of Arkansas - Clinton

John Bennett  PH:  870-573-6882
ALL OR NONE:  

             FOB:  (D-8) -  Yell, Conway (4), Van Buren (2)

Paragould, AR  72450

Within 60 days from date of award
Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION     
ARDOT - TABULATION

Mineral Aggregate Class 4

District rejects bid on Item #3.  They 
have enough chips on hand to complete 
in house. 


	Short Tab

