ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-20-207H

Page 1
Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

Special Provision

High Performance Cold Mix

Bidders Per Ton Haul Price
APAC-Central, Inc.
Barling, AR
Preston NO BID RECEIVED

479-587-3369

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Memphis, TN
Forrest City NO BID RECEIVED

870-630-1290

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.
Memphis, TN

W. Memphis NO BID RECEIVED
870-735-2880

Asphalt Producers, LLC
Jonesboro, AR

Valley View 100.00 .25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min
870-932-1306

Asphalt Producers, LLC
Jonesboro, AR

Portable Plant - Brinkley 100.00 .25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min
870-932-1306

Asphalt Products LLC
Little Rock, AR
501-407-9643 NO BID RECEIVED

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1)
Batesville, AR

Rose Bud 95.00 .23/tn per mile w/$4.00 min
870-251-2371

Code: 00-09

Tentatively Awarded By: Purchasing Committee Date: 6/26/2019
Awarded To: As Per Tabulation
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Date of Contract: July 1, 2019 thru September 30, 2019 Opening Date: June 4, 2019

Bidders

Special Provision

High Performance Cold Mix
Per Ton

Haul Price

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1)
Batesville, AR
Mountain View
870-269-7222

95.00

.23/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (1)
Batesville, AR
Midwest Lane
870-793-4581

95.00

.23/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2)
Jonesboro, AR
Black Rock

870-932-1246

NO BID RECEIVED

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. (2)
Jonesboro, AR

102 Bearden Drive
870-935-8277

95.00

.25/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Blackstone Construction LLC
Russellville, AR

Russellville Plant 1 & 3
479-968-1149

NO BID RECEIVED

Covington Enterprises, Inc.
Rogers, AR

Bentonville

479-621-9034

NO BID RECEIVED

Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR

Little Rock

501-945-7176

115.00

NO BID

Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
Malvern - Jones Mill
501-945-7176

NO BID RECEIVED
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Special Provision

High Performance Cold Mix

Bidders Per Ton Haul Price
Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
N. Little Rock 115.00 NO BID

501-945-7176

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.

Paragould, AR
Black Rock, AR
870-573-6882

NO BID RECEIVED

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.

Paragould, AR
Bee Branch
870-573-6882

95.00

.27/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.

Paragould, AR
Judsonia
870-573-6882

95.00

.27/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.

Paragould, AR
Luxora
870-573-6882

95.00

.27/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR

Paragould

870-573-6882

95.00

.27/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR
Tuckerman

870-349-2995

NO BID RECEIVED
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Special Provision

High Performance Cold Mix

Bidders Per Ton Haul Price
Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO
Gravette, AR 90.00 *kk

479-298-0052

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO

Monett, MO NO BID RECEIVED
417-847-2489

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO (Material Depot)
Springdale, AR (Recycle Plant For

Asphalt Shingles & Wrap Only) MO EID RECENED
479-927-0257

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO

Sonora Plant, Springdale, AR 100.00 Fkk
479-927-0257

Jay-Pac Inc.
Morrilton, AR
#1 Hixon Road, Plumerville, AR 110.00 .30/tn per mile
501-354-4175

JoB Const. Co., Inc.
Poteau, OK

Poteau, OK NO BID RECEIVED
918/654-3536

Lehman-Roberts Co.
Memphis, TN

2360 West Belmont Circle, Memphis NO BID RECEIVED
901-327-3595

***See attached for Haul Prices
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Bidders

Special Provision

High Performance Cold Mix
Per Ton

Haul Price

Lehman-Roberts Co.
2840 Carrier Rd.
Memphis, TN
901-482-1755

NO BID RECEIVED

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.
Pine Bluff, AR
Monticello

870-541-8058

110.00

NO BID

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.
Pine Bluff, AR

Kansas Street & River

Pine Bluff

870-534-7120

105.00

NO BID

R. K. Hall, LLC
Paris, TX

Texarkana, AR
903-559-1276

110.00

.27/tn per mile w/ $6.00 min

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR
Greenbrier
501-679-6230

NO BID RECEIVED

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR

Cabot, AR - Hwy 5 North
501-843-5154

105.00

.30/tn per mile w/ $3.75 min

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR

2540 Hwy 5, El Paso, AR
501-796-2323

NO BID RECEIVED

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY




ASPHDTS
10035 RECYCLABLE

Main Office: 1007 Main Street - Cassville, MO 65625 °
phone (417) B47-2489 - Fax (417) 847-5561

www. hutchensconstruction.com Toll Free (888) PAVEITZ - (888) 728-3482

Rock

Asphalt

Rock

Asphalt Rock Asphalt Rock Asphalt
1| 1.61 1.92 17| 4.95 | 5.78 33| 8.27 | 9.64 491 11.60 | 13.46
2| 1.82 | 2.16 18| 5.14 | 6.02 34| 8.45 | 9.85 50| 11.79 ] 13.70
3| 2.01 2.42 19| 5.34 | 6.25 35| 8.68 110.12 51]112.00 | 13.95
4| 2.23 2.67 201 5.55 6.49 36| 8.89 | 10.35 52| 12.22 | 14.21
5| 2.44 | 2.87 21! 537 | 6.I3 37| 9.11 | 10.59 53112431 14.45
6| 2.67 | 3.12 221 5096 | 697 38| 9.30 | 10.83 541 12.62 | 14.69
Z| 2.85 1 3.8 P31 6,17 | 122 39| 9.51 | 11:08 55]12.84 | 14.94
81 3.07 | 3.62 24| 6.38 | 7.46 40| 9.73 | 11.32 56| 13.05 | 15.15
9] 3.29 | 3.86 25| 6.60 | 7.70 41| 9.94 | 11.54 57| 13.27 | 15.40
10| 3.50 | 4.10 26| 6.79 | 7.92 42] 10.13} 11.78 58| 13.46 | 15.64
11| 3.69 | 4.35 27 .01 | 8417 43} 10.35 12.03 591 13.67 | 15.89
12| 3.90 | 4.57 28| 7.22 | 8.41 | 441 10.56 | 12.27 601 13.90 | 16.13
13] 4.11 4.81 29| 7.43 | 8.67 451 10.78 | 12.51 gd| 1a 42 116,37
14| 4.30 | 5.05 30| 7.62 | 8.91 46| 10.97 | 12.75 62| 14.31 | 16.61
15| 4.52 5.a0) 3Ll .83 | 916 471 11.18 | 13.00 63| 14.52 | 16.84
161 4.73 5.54 32| 8.05 | 9.40 481 11.40 | 13.22 64| 14.74 | 17.08
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